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INCUMBENTS:  
 2nd District – Vacant 
  
 
QUALIFICATIONS 
Unless otherwise specifically provided, no person is eligible to be elected or appointed to an 
elective office unless that person is a registered voter and otherwise qualified to vote for that office 
at the time that nomination papers are issued to the person or at the time of the person’s 
appointment. (§24001, Gov. C.; §13.5, 201, EC) 
 
A member of the Board of Supervisors shall have been a registered voter of the district that he/she 
seeks to represent for at least 30 days immediately preceding the deadline for filing nomination 
documents, and shall reside in the district during incumbency.  (§25041, Gov. C.) 
 

TERMS OF OFFICE 
Two (2) years commencing upon election to and qualification for office expiring the first Monday 
after January 1st, 2027.   (§24200, Gov. C.) 

FILING FEES 
(§§8061, 8062, 8103-8105, EC) 

 
NON-REFUNDABLE FILING FEE $1,104.25 
% ANNUAL SALARY 1% 
NOMINATION SIGNATURES 20-40 

 
 

CANDIDATE STATEMENT COST 
(200 words) 

Each candidate that desires to file a statement will be required to make a deposit at the time of 
filing their statement, based upon the number of registered voters in the district for the office for 
which they are filing.  If the actual costs are less than the deposit, the overage will be refunded to 
the candidate, likewise the candidate must sign an agreement to pay any additional billing if the 
costs exceed the deposit. 
 
PLEASE NOTE: Estimated costs are based on one statement being filed per office.  Final costs 
will vary if multiple candidates for the same office file statements and share in the associated 
costs. 
 

2nd District Supervisor Statement Cost $2,444 
 
Kern County Ordinance (Chapter 2.130.010 – 2.130.230). Any person, who is running for 
Supervisor or a Countywide Office who voluntarily accepted the Local Campaign Finance 
expenditure limits prior to accepting contributions, is entitled to a free candidate statement in the 
Kern County Voter Pamphlet. See pages 34 through 35 of the Candidate Handbook for further 
information.  If you remain unopposed at the close of nominations, you may either choose to 
withdraw your candidate statement OR be billed for the cost of its inclusion in the Voter Pamphlet. 



If withdrawn, the statement will appear on the Elections website but will not be included in 
materials mailed to voters. 
 


